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Abstract
At the heart of the Mediterranean crossroads, lie two islands that bridge North and
South, islands that will undoubtedly continue to experience flows of migrants and
refugees, like the ones that have caused such a furore during the last decade. Malta
and Cyprus were admitted into the European Union (EU) in 2004, a fact that has
greatly affected the type of migration they are both experiencing and the related
policy responses. Moreover, they lie between the shores of rich Europe, with its
declining birth rates and consequent labour shortages, and poor Africa with its
burgeoning jobless population, visible demarcations of the North-South divide and
the related South-North migration routes into the EU. Their geographic location now
means that they are lucky enough to be considered part of “Europe”, but must also
bear the consequences as their borders have been redefined as external EU
borders in need of fortification and control.  

This paper is a comparative analysis of how Malta and Cyprus are coping with their
new migration realities as member states on the European Union’s southern
periphery. I will first discuss what the two islands have in common and where they
differ in terms of migration and the responses to this relatively new phenomenon for
countries historically known as countries of emigration. Where can lessons learnt
be shared and what does each of these countries have to gain from the experience
of the other? This discussion will be framed within the accession of the two states
to the EU. Although part of the rich club, they are also minor political players within
the Union and therefore hold little power to affect the type of migration and asylum
policies they are obliged to enact as member states. Indeed, as members, they are
now not simply facing new forms of migration, but have also been placed in the
difficult position of acting as gatekeepers. In this context, EU policies and directives
have impelled them to adopt increasingly restrictive migration policies.

Keywords: Cyprus, Malta, European Union, migration, migration controls, externalisation,
asylum, irregular migration, refugees, mixed flows.  
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Introduction

On 1 May 2004, Cyprus1 and Malta became two of the newest members to join the
European Union (EU), along with eight Central and Eastern European countries, in
the biggest enlargement the EU has experienced, both in terms of population and
landmass.2 In the run-up to the 2004 ‘big bang’ enlargement, the focus around
Europe was mainly on the possibilities of mass migration from Eastern Europe. As
might have been expected, migration projections into or out of the new southern
European members were not considered to be as significant. Malta and Cyprus are
of course small countries, with populations of 401,880 and 788,457 respectively.3
Moreover, the numbers of migrants and refugees arriving in Malta and Cyprus are
small, if compared unequivocally to other countries in Southern Europe.

They are latecomers to the migration phenomenon experienced by Southern
European countries, which transitioned earlier from countries of emigration to those
of immigration. The academic literature written on this evolution in Southern Europe
is significant, but has focused primarily on larger countries, such as Italy, Spain,
Greece and Portugal.4 This sudden transformation has raised social, economic and
legal issues for which administrations have not been prepared. Unfortunately, host
populations have also seen an increase in hostility towards non-EU nationals, who
are perceived as a threat to the national culture and economy.5 Although Malta and
Cyprus are largely absent in this academic literature, they have recently become
much more vocal in EU fora while protesting the “unfair burden” being placed on
them in terms of migration as new member states on external borders. 

Indeed, as new EU members, the two islands have had their borders redefined
as external borders in need of fortification and control. Located on the EU’s
southern rim, which has been characterised by some as the “soft, vulnerable
underbelly of Fortress Europe”,6 these countries are considered a liability due to the
porous nature of their borders and the large informal sectors in their economies.
Moreover, the two islands find themselves at the crossroads between Europe, the
Middle East and Africa, strategically placed in a position to either bridge or divide
the Mediterranean region.  

As dead bodies wash up on the shores of the Mediterranean, it is clear that a
tragic human crisis with far-reaching social and political implications is at stake.
What light can these uniquely situated islands shed on the recent debates over
migration to Europe? Located along the EU’s southern periphery, they are important
with regard to the continued attempts in Europe to externalise asylum processes
and focus on short-term restrictive policies, rather than protective, human rights
based policies. In this context, EU policies and directives have impelled Malta and
Cyprus to adopt increasingly restrictive migration policies in line with their new roles
as members on the external border. This paper first looks in turn at each of these
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countries and the new migration realities they face. Then, trends across the two
cases will be highlighted, with a focus on the public and media discourses
surrounding migration, the affects of EU membership in general, and the specific
affects of the emphasis within the EU on externalising migration controls, as well as
asylum processes. 

Migration Realities of Mediterranean Island States

During the twentieth century, large numbers of civilians from both Malta and Cyprus
sought better opportunities in richer countries such as the UK, the USA, Canada,
Australia and South Africa. Indeed, the high unemployment levels on the islands
after World War II caused many to emigrate in the post-war period, encouraged in
part by schemes such as subsidised steamship fares. Cyprus and Malta were then
British colonies, but gained independence in 1960 and 1964, respectively, although
the Queen remained Malta’s head of state until 1974 and British troops were not
expelled from the island until 1979. Although these two former British colonies
experienced similar histories of emigration, the end of the twentieth century brought
with it different immigration patterns and realities for the two islands. 

Cyprus

Although Cypriot migration has a long history, the divisions between the two
constitutionally recognised communities and the events of 1974 dramatically
increased the number of emigrants leaving the island. Since independence, the
country has struggled with the ethnic tensions between Greek-Cypriots and
Turkish-Cypriots, who make up 82% and 18% of the population, respectively. This
tension, culminating in the forced division of the island in 1974, has been explicitly
linked to demographic concerns and migration to the island, a tension exacerbated
by the Turkish government’s encouragement of the settlement of its nationals in
northern Cyprus.7

The coup carried out by the Greek junta and the subsequent Turkish invasion
of northern Cyprus dealt a severe blow to the Cypriot economy. With a 37% loss of
the island’s territory to Turkey, GDP fell by 18% between 1973 and 1975 (falling to
842 million Cypriot pounds), while unemployment increased by 30% (reaching
22.5% in 1975).8 In spite of this devastating poverty, economic growth followed in
the 1980s and 90s primarily due to mass tourism, the expansion of the tertiary
sector, and considerable monetary investments from refugees fleeing the Lebanese
civil war. What has been referred to as an “economic miracle” was made possible
in part by the cheap labour supplied by the 200,000 Greek-Cypriot refugees who
were expelled from the northern part of the island after the Turkish invasion.9 Thus
during this time, Cyprus had little need for migrant labour from other countries and
maintained restrictive immigration policies.
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However, in the late 1980s, the economic growth on the island led to a demand
for labour that exceeded the supply of the native population.10 Therefore, in 1990,
Cyprus abandoned its restrictive policies and started granting a large number of
temporary work visas to foreigners. Today, these work permits are granted for a
period of four years, and are attached to a specific employer within a sector that is
deemed to have labour shortages that Cypriots cannot or will not fill. Until recently,
the permits were granted for six years, a time period was shortened in response to
concern that an EU directive on the long-term residence of third-country nationals
could allow for permanent settlement after five years.11 The introduction of this
legislation in 1990 resulted in an increase of documented migrant workers
(excluding domestic workers) from 545 in 1990 to 10,370 in 1996 and to 30,225 in
2005.12 In addition, there were an estimated 15,863 migrant workers employed as
domestic labourers in 2005. Although the majority of migrants work as domestic
workers, the service industry (including tourism),13 manufacturing, agriculture and
construction industries also attract a large amount of migrant labour.14

The changes in patterns of migration to Cyprus in the early 1990s were also
affected by political events occurring internationally. The break-up of the Soviet
Union resulted in labour migration from countries that were previously part of the
USSR. Most notably, Pontic Greeks migrated from the Caucasus region, as they
were entitled to Greek nationality, which allowed them to immigrate to Cyprus
without the normal bureaucratic formalities. Unsurprisingly, conflicts such as the
Gulf War in the early 90s, ongoing turmoil in Palestine, and the War in the Balkans
during this decade contributed to the flow of migrants, as well as political and
economic refugees arriving in Cyprus. The US-led invasion of Iraq in 2003 and the
resulting mayhem and suffering has also added to the number of asylum seekers
as Iraqis have fled their homeland.

Irregular Migrants
In 2005, the total number of non-Cypriot residents, including irregular migrants, was
estimated to be between 80,000 and 100,000, or approximately 10-13% of the
population. The figures for irregular migrants are inherently difficult to obtain, but
are thought to be between 10,000 and 30,000.15 Other estimates range even more
widely, from 6,000 to 45,000.16 These irregular migrants include people from China,
and from countries in Eastern Europe (Bulgaria, Romania, ex-Yugoslavia, Russia,
Ukraine, Georgia, and Moldova, among others), in Southeast Asia (especially
women who are employed as domestic workers from the Philippines, Sri Lanka,
India and Pakistan), and in the Middle East (Syria, Lebanon, Iran, Iraq, to name a
few).17

As is the case in wider Europe, most irregular migrants in Cyprus are
‘overstayers’, people who overstay their visas or people who work outside the realm
of their visas, a phenomenon previously prevalent amongst overseas students in
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Cyprus. During the 1990s, irregular migrants also arrived in Cyprus by sea from
countries in the Middle East, such as Lebanon. However, the demilitarisation of the
“green line” dividing the island in April 2003 has meant that irregular migrants can
now move more easily into the southern part of Cyprus, and thus into the EU, by
crossing this division. The partial lifting of the restrictions in movement has also
allowed several thousand Turkish-Cypriots to cross the demarcation zone every
day in order to work in the southern part, primarily in the construction industry. The
government claims that at least 80% of all irregular migrants in Cyprus arrive by
crossing the “green line”, a claim that ignores the reality of ‘overstayers’ and feeds
ethnic tension on the island.18

Asylum
As the EU’s third smallest member, Cyprus has also recently experienced an
increase in asylum applications. Between 2002 and 2003, the annual total
increased by 363%; while in Europe as a whole it fell by 20%.19 In 2007, the total
number of submitted asylum applications was 6,790 – not a large number in
absolute terms. However, if one takes the size of the population into account,
Cyprus received the largest number of asylum applicants per 1,000 inhabitants out
of 51 European and non-European industrialised countries in 2007.20 The number
of applicants in 2007, if taken on a per capita basis, is equivalent to over 500,000
applicants in the UK and France (where the actual number of asylum applicants for
2007 were 27,900 and 19,160, respectively), and over 700,000 in Germany (19,160
applicants).21 Obviously, such comparisons are limited in their usefulness and may
be used unscrupulously by governments to sensationalise the issues around
migration and asylum and to shirk their responsibilities of protection.22 They are
used here to illustrate that the relatively small number of asylum claims made in
Cyprus (and Malta, discussed below) when compared to other EU member states,
may be viewed in a different light if one takes into account population size,
population density or GDP.

In 2005 and 2006, Syrian nationals made the largest number of asylum
applications, between 15% and 18%. Over the past five years, other nationalities
that have been amongst the most numerous have been Sri Lankan, Georgian,
Bangladeshi, Iranian, Pakistani, Indian, Chinese, Ukrainian, Iraqi and Russian.23 In
2003, Cyprus experienced firsthand an idiosyncrasy of the asylum system as the
number of Bangladeshi and Pakistani asylum applications soared unexpectedly, the
overwhelming majority coming from students who were on legitimate student visas.
The principal reason for applying for asylum seemed to be that asylum seekers are
given the right to access the labour market, while at this time people holding student
visas were not. These applications were rejected, and as an example to others
falsely claiming asylum, some of the students were deported back to their countries
of origin without being able to finish their studies. Much stricter controls were also
implemented for the granting of student visas. And perhaps more progressively,

ON THE EDGE OF EXCLUSION

23



Cyprus adopted an EU directive in 200724 that allows third-country nationals to work
while pursuing their studies through an amendment to the Aliens and Immigration
Law, which now entitles such students to work on a part-time basis for up to 20
hours during term and 40 hours during holidays.25

Having previously relied on support from the UNHCR for the processing of
asylum applications, and often the resettling of recognised refugees, Cyprus was
faced with the task of putting in place new national asylum systems (which began
operating in January 2002) in order to comply with EU legislation before joining the
Union.26 As in Malta, the increase in asylum claims over the past five years caught
the authorities unprepared and created severe delays in processing claims, delays
which last up to two or three years.27 Low recognition rates are another feature of
the new Cypriot asylum system. Since 2004, many more asylum seekers have
received temporary protection than refugee status, although the rates still remain
low – between 1.6% and 3% – even with the inclusion of those granted temporary
protection. In 2005, the Cypriot government, as well as the UNHCR, pointed to false
claims as a reason for the low rates of recognition for refugees, which were less
than one per cent for the previous year.28 However, the rate has remained below
one per cent in subsequent years.29

Asylum seekers are in principle not detained while their application is being
processed and are given permission to work. However, Amnesty International
reports that out of the 12,000 asylum seekers in Cyprus in May 2007, only 300 held
work permits. They report similar finding for the government’s monthly stipend of
480 dollars afforded to asylum seekers: only 350 asylum seekers received it in
2007.30 There are also reports that asylum seekers are being denied the right to
work and access to healthcare, housing and social benefits. Most therefore resort
to trying to make a living by working in the informal sector, where they are
vulnerable to abuse and exploitation.31

Detention is also a reality as failed asylum seekers and irregular migrants may
be arrested and kept in the Central Prison in Nicosia or other police stations around
the country. Amnesty International reported that in September and October 2007,
detainees in the infamous Block 10 – a two-storey building within the Prison in
Nicosia, which serves as a detention centre for rejected asylum seekers under
deportation orders – several of whom had been held for over 30 months, protested
against the length and conditions of their detention.32 Unfortunately, the government
does not officially report the number of failed asylum seekers and migrants held and
the length of their detention.

The Cyprus Problem and the EU
Migration to Cyprus is often associated with the ‘Cyprus problem’, the division of the
island that occurred after the Turkish invasion in 1974. The settlement of non-
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nationals is viewed within this framework as dangerous for the demographic
character of the island. Moreover, restrictive migration policies are defended as
necessary in order to protect the fabric of the nation, which is already under threat
from the northern occupiers. This line of reasoning is certainly encouraged by the
fact that Turkey has successfully promoted the settlement of Turkish nationals in
northern Cyprus, a policy that has deepened the conflict on the island.33

The new realities of migration to the island have also been politicised within the
discourse of the ‘Cyprus problem’. For example, the claim that as many as 97% of
all irregular migrants reach Cyprus by travelling through the occupied northern part
appears opportunistic, as it disassociates the phenomenon from the new economic
and political realities in Cyprus, as well as more globally, that encourage this type
of migration. As has already been noted, many irregular migrants have in fact
overstayed their visas rather than entered irregularly, a phenomenon fuelled by the
government’s reluctance to grant long-term residence status.34

The division on the island is further complicated by Cyprus’ new status as a
member of the European Union. EU membership was previously hailed as the
answer to the division of the island, but was not realised when Greek-Cypriots
rejected the Annan Plan as excessively pro-Turkish in a referendum in 2004.
Nevertheless, the island as a whole was accepted into the Union, with the acquis
communautaire suspended temporarily in the northern part, since the ‘TRNC’ is not
recognised by the EU.35 Therefore the “green line” is not technically considered an
external EU border, although it is treated as one politically, as is clear in the Cypriot
government’s rhetoric on irregular migrants crossing the demarcation line. The
division of the island is thus emphasised and entrenched through the government
rhetoric concerning the need to “protect” this zone. This issue will merit even more
consideration when Cyprus adopts the Schengen agreement, which it plans to do
in 2009 and which will theoretically abolish all passport controls for those travelling
to other Schengen countries within the EU.36 Turkey’s pending membership to the
EU would also add another dimension to this picture should it come to fruition. 

Malta

Malta, like Cyprus, has a long history of emigration, which increased considerably
during the post World War II era, when destruction incurred during the War and high
levels of poverty and rates of unemployment caused many Maltese to search for
better lives abroad, most often in Australia, Canada, the UK and the USA.37 Malta’s
legislation on migration reflects this history, as the only relevant policy during the
latter half of the twentieth century was the Immigration Act of 1970.38 Although
Malta signed the Geneva Convention in 1968, to which it held a geographic
limitation until 2001, there was no national refugee or asylum legislation until the
Refugee Act was implemented in 200139 in order to align Maltese policies with EU
legislation before accession took place in 2004.
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Although Malta and Cyprus have similar histories of emigration, their more
recent experiences with immigration have differed quite significantly. Over the last
eighteen years, Cyprus has received and indeed encouraged a significant number
of economic migrants to fill shortages in the labour market, which have not existed
to such a degree in Malta. Rather, the migration debate in Malta has only come to
the political forefront in 2002 and has centred on the “boat people” who arrive on
the island from the North African shore, usually having departed from Libya
(although the very large majority are not Libyan nationals). The number of these
people increased dramatically and unexpectedly from 57 in 2001 to 1,686 in 2002,
catching the Maltese authorities unprepared. This figure remained between 1,500
and 2,000 in subsequent years, with the exception of 2003, when it fell to 503.40 In
2007, there were 2,106 migrants and asylum seekers being housed in open centres
around the island and over 1,300 were incarcerated in the three detention centres
on the island.41 Although, the numbers of migrants and asylum seekers arriving are
low when compared to the numbers arriving in other EU members states, the
Maltese government has repeatedly pointed to Malta’s small size and to the fact
that the population density (1,200 per square kilometre) is one of the highest in the
world and thus the affects of these arrivals are exponential.42 For example, the
1,272 asylum applications that were lodged in Malta in 2006 are equivalent to
199,226 in France and 188,977 in the UK. The actual asylum claims made in these
countries were 26,300 and 27,850, respectively.43 The Maltese government thus
continues to ask the European Union to share the responsibility of the migration
‘burden’, a request that until recently has fallen on deaf ears.44

Most of the migrants and refugees arriving in Malta come from sub-Sahara
Africa, the largest percentages of asylum applications having come from Somalis,
Eritreans and Sudanese over the past five years.45 These migrants usually travel
through Africa until they reach Libya, where they may work for a number of years
until they can earn enough money for the voyage across the Mediterranean.46 The
focus in Maltese debates and legislation has thus been on deterring migrants from
arriving in Malta by implementing harsh, restrictive policies, such as the island’s
lengthy detention policy of up to 18 months. This approach is fuelled and
simultaneously justified by the fact that many of the migrants claim they never
intended to come to Malta, nor to stay there, but were either picked up by the Armed
Forces on their way to mainland Europe because they were in distress while at sea
or landed on the island believing they had arrived in Sicily or Italy.  

It is important to make two observations here: first, that it is politically
convenient for Malta to maintain that most of the migrants do not want to remain, a
logic which helps the government portray Malta as a victim of migration patterns
and EU legislation; and second, focusing on this fact disregards global patterns
which point to the likelihood that Malta will continue to receive migrants and
refugees in the coming years. There is also some preliminary evidence suggesting
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that Malta is in fact a final destination for a handful of the migrants, a reality that will
likely continue as the migrant population grows, begins to fill gaps in the labour
market, and networks are established between Malta and countries of origin.47

The Blurry Line: ‘Illegal’ Migrants or Asylum Seekers?
When migrants, the majority of whom are male, are apprehended by the Armed
Forces, they are immediately labelled ‘illegal’ and are transported to one of the
three detention centres on the island. It is from detention that most apply for asylum,
since it is their only legal recourse either for staying in Malta or continuing their
voyage to continental Europe. After spending months in detention, failed asylum
seekers, recognised refugees, those with temporary protection as well as irregular
migrants who have not applied for asylum all move into one of the “open centres”
on the island. The open centres are run by various organisations funded by the
government and are all perpetually plagued with overcrowding. The inadequate
conditions are evident in the newest open centre in Hal Far that officially houses
600 migrants and refugees and is called a ‘tent city’ due to the canvas tents that
have been erected in place of buildings. The tents obviously provide little shelter or
protection from rain and cold temperatures in winter and soaring temperatures in
summer. 

Until 2002, the limited number of asylum claims made in Malta was processed
by the UNHCR office in Rome with the help of the Emigrant Commission in Malta,
a non-governmental organisation set up in 1950 to help Maltese citizens wanting to
settle abroad.48 The Refugee Act of 2001 replaced this arrangement and created a
new, nationally run asylum system, which included the post of Refugee
Commissioner, under whose auspice asylum claims and appeals have been
assessed since January 2002. The young system has been hindered by the
unexpected number of asylum claims made, as well as the lack of staff due to a
limited budget and difficulties in obtaining adequate personnel, especially
translators. The result is a slow application process during which asylum seekers
are kept in detention for up to 12 months.49

The Maltese government claims to have one of the highest rates of granting
protection to asylum seekers in Europe. In 2006 (up to May), 49.2% of applicants
had been granted some form of protection, the majority (47.1%) temporary
humanitarian protection. When compared with the recognition rates in Cyprus, this
is obviously a much bigger percentage. However, since Malta has created its own
asylum system and the UNHCR no longer resettles recognised refugees from the
island, there has been a significant shift towards granting people temporary
protection rather than permanent refugee status.50 This trend is politically
convenient for Malta as it reinforces the idea of the island as a place that migrants
temporarily transit and not a place where they might want to settle permanently.
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Maltese laws allow for the detention of irregular migrants for up to 18 months
and asylum seekers for up to 12 months – a policy which is expensive51 and serves
to criminalise people who have committed no crime.52 Moreover, it has weathered
heavy criticism from human rights groups on the island, in Europe and
internationally. The detainees themselves have held peaceful protests, even
breaking out of the centres in order to march to the Prime Minister’s office.53 People
who have often had traumatic experiences in their country of origin and during their
journeys are detained for an unacceptable and inhumane length of time in appalling
conditions. Overcrowded centres are the norm, and dirty conditions have spread
diseases such as tuberculosis. The lack of privacy in the centres also causes
tension between the detainees, which is exacerbated by being reduced to total
idleness and provided with no form of physical or mental stimulation. Prolonged
detainment in such unhealthy conditions also produces severe psychological
affects.54 The lack of attention to the mental health of detainees has been
highlighted by the Council of Europe, which also reported on the need for on-the-
spot psychiatric care, especially considering the traumas often experienced by
migrants and refugees.55

The lack of transparency is also a cause for concern.  Only a limited number of
NGOs have been given access to closed detention centres and even the press did
not previously have a right to enter, except for the occasional pre-arranged ‘tours’
given by the government. The government maintained that this was in order to
protect potential refugees and “to protect the families and friends of detainees who
are still in their homeland from retribution by the regime against which protection
claims are being made.”56 As Neil Falzon, the UNHCR representative in Malta,
pointed out, this excuse is hardly valid and journalists should be given access “so
that through their reporting, they will be able to teach the Maltese people more
about the refugee situation …”57 Similar criticism has also come from many other
organisations, institutions and individuals, such as the European Justice
Commissioner Franco Frattini and the European Parliament.58 After the general
election in March 2008, this policy was, however, reversed, thus allowing journalists
to file requests to enter detention centres, by the newly appointed Minister for
Justice and Home Affairs, Carmelo Mifsud Bonnici, who argued that the
government “… [has] nothing to hide” and must be more transparent.59

Although these are significant improvements, the government’s lack of
acceptance and insensitivity to the phenomenon of migration in Malta is still well
illustrated through the asylum system and especially the detention policy. The
migrants that arrive do not fit neatly into legal and political categories, which are
narrow and do not reflect migrant agency, the multiple “push” and “pull” factors
involved, or artificial boundaries and mechanisms operated by states that may
interrupt a migrant’s journey. This is of course not a phenomenon limited to the
Maltese islands.
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Table 1: Asylum Applications and Recognition Rates in Malta and Cyprus, 1995-2008*

Source: ‘UNHCR Statistical Yearbook’, ‘Country Data Sheets, 2005’; ‘2007 Global Trends: Refugees, Asylum-seekers,
Returnees, Internally Displaced and Stateless Persons’; ‘Asylum Claims in Industrialized Countries, Monthly data: January –
September 2008’; For statistics on Malta, cf. National Statistics Office figures; For figures on arrivals in Malta see, for 2002-2005,
National Statistic Office, Malta, ‘World Refugee Day News Release 2006’; and for 2006 and onwards, see Herman Grech,
‘Portrait of Africa’, Times of Malta, 11 November 2007.

*Asylum Applications are those received within the year and also include appeals. Recognition numbers are those also
recognised (or not) within the year and thus do not necessarily correspond with the asylum applications made that year as is
evident in the 1996 recognition rates for Malta. These rates are given as an indication of the percentages being granted some
form of protection.  

**For the first three quarters of 2008 (Jan.-Sept.). Recognition data for 2008 was not available at time of writing. 



T
H

E
 C

Y
P

R
U

S
 R

E
V

IE
W

  (V
O

L. 20:2 FA
LL 2008)

30

Asylum Claims in 2005

Source: UNHCR Asylum Levels and Trends in Industrialized Countries, 2005

http://www.unhcr.org/statistics/STATISTICS/44153f592.pdf



Cyprus and Malta: Trends and Trajectories

Despite the fact that the number of migrants and asylum seekers arriving in Malta
and Cyprus are small in absolute terms, it is clear that per capita, the two small
islands are experiencing a large amount of asylum applications. Between 2003 and
2007, Cyprus received 39 asylum seekers per 1,000 inhabitants, the highest level
in Europe. Malta was ranked third after Sweden, with 13 and 15 asylum seekers per
1,000 inhabitants, respectively. These numbers have overwhelmed the newly
established asylum systems in both countries and lead to unacceptable delays in
the processes, during which asylum seekers remain in a vulnerable state, either
deprived of one of their most fundamental freedoms in a Maltese detention centre
or a Cypriot prison, or with limited opportunities and government support within the
community.  

The government and media portrayal of these countries being overwhelmed or
invaded allows for the justification of long delays in asylum processes, poor
reception standards, and the shirking of the responsibility to protect asylum seekers
and refugees. The continuation of a discourse that interprets the migration
phenomenon as a result of inadequate border controls or of new laws imposed by
the EU is not only naïve, but destructive to the integration of migrants and refugees
into Maltese and Cypriot societies, especially in terms of durable settlement
possibilities. 

Another key aspect in keeping up this appearance is the insistence that both
countries are transit points for migrants and asylum seekers, who intend to continue
on to continental Europe, a journey thwarted by EU regulations, such as the Dublin
II Convention.60 Although this assumption does reflect reality to some extent, more
so perhaps in Malta where the labour market is smaller and opportunities fewer, it
has been abused by politicians in order to attract EU support in the form of financial
aid and ‘burden-sharing’ initiatives. Consequently, the focus of the migration debate
and ensuing policies has shifted into the realm of security and control, rather than
human rights and integration. What appears to be more pertinent however is the
fact that they are no longer simply countries of emigration or even immigration but
caught in the middle, countries of transit migration in transition, now required to
become outposts of EU migration control.61

Fundamentally important to this new reality is the fact that the flow of people
moving across the EU’s southern border is a “mixed flow” – that is it includes people
who are seeking asylum and refugee protection, as laid out in the 1951 Geneva
Convention and its subsequent protocol (1967), as well as people who are seeking
better economic opportunities. The response by nation states to these flows have
erred towards more draconian migration controls, causing organisations such as
the UNHCR to call for a differentiation between different types of migrants in order
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to continue to afford adequate protection to refugees. It has also led to an academic
discussion of the asylum-migration nexus.62 Moreover, the recognition of mixed
flows highlights how fundamentally the geopolitics of the Cold War, the historical
context in which the Convention and the UNHCR were conceived, affected the
definitions and structures of the institution. Having not been re-examined, the result
is the continued use of a narrow definition63 that reifies a politicised and superficial
division between political and economic migrants, which reflects poorly the reality
where individual agency entwines with often indistinguishable political and
economic ‘push’ and ‘pull’ factors.  

Public and Media Discourses
The public and media discourses surrounding migration on the two island states
largely ignore the realities of mixed flows of migration. Instead, the high number of
economic and irregular migrants has added to the distrust of asylum seekers as
‘bogus’ refugees. This omission in the migration story has been detrimental to the
reception of migrants in Malta and Cyprus and has added to prevalent racism,
xenophobia, and feelings of invasion that are widely expressed in both countries. In
Cyprus, the media have encouraged the association between migration and
negative social consequences, such as unemployment, the break-up of marriages,
criminality, and the national problem of Turkish occupation.64

In Malta, local NGOs as well as international organisations have criticised the
government for not doing enough to curb the growth of racism. For example, the
policy of handcuffing migrants and asylum seekers while transporting them, as well
as the broader detention policy, serve to criminalise people who have committed no
crime and negatively affect the way Maltese people perceive them. The government
has also been criticised for sending the wrong message to the Maltese population
by emphasising the numbers and the cost of migration and even making racist
remarks themselves, linking migrants and asylum seekers to crime, terrorism, and
the spread of illness.65 Katrine Camilleri, Assistant Director of Jesuit Refugee
Services Malta, said, “A lot of statements have been made, even by those in
authority, associating immigrants with illness and with a security threat. Obviously
anyone can be sick … it has nothing to do with nationality. But, irregular immigrants
have been publicly associated with illness or with the threat that they might be
terrorists. Of course, so could anyone else and we’re more likely to be than they
are. No terrorist is going to come and spend 18 months in Safi [Detention Centre]
... But, the fact that in the public mind we have made these associations is very
dangerous.”66

In both countries, the perception of being invaded by migrants and asylum
seekers is encouraged by ignorance and misinformation, leading to xenophobia and
racism. This racism is fuelled by two complementary factors based largely on fear:
the fear of losing economic security and the related perception of material scarcity,
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an image propagated by the governments’ rhetoric within the EU regarding Malta
and Cyprus’ inability to cope with the ‘burden’ of migrants and refugees; and the
fear of losing one’s national identity, a fear exacerbated by stereotypes and myths
relating to both the national culture and cultures of the migrants and refugees. The
perception of Maltese and Cypriot societies as homogenous, along with the state’s
condonation of racism through its exclusionary practices, has further aggravated
the issue.67 The migrant is thus constructed by nationals as the ‘other’, who is both
inferior and threatening, challenging traditional divisions between nationals and
non-nationals through the act of migration, as well as a group’s sense of identity
within a specific culture, territory or ethnicity.68

As McGhee points out, host communities must be educated about ethnic
minorities and their culture in order for integration to take place effectively.69

Education, after all, is fundamental in the struggle against the perpetuation of
intolerance and inequality within a society.  An interesting study undertaken with
Greek-Cypriot students demonstrates both the detrimental nature of narrow
nationalistic and ethno-centric citizenship studies, and in turn, the effectiveness of
education awareness campaigns in combating racism and xenophobia, and their
positive influence on attitudes towards migration.70 Unfortunately, comprehensive
education campaigns dealing with the new realities of migration, as well as the new
realities of globalisation and wider economic, political and social patterns, are by
and large absent in Malta and Cyprus, although NGOs attempt to fill some of the
gaps produced by the lack of a comprehensive government-led initiative.71

The European Union: Demon or Saint?
In the run up to the 2004 ‘big bang’ enlargement, Malta was the first candidate state
to hold a referendum on EU membership. The high turn out (91%) and the narrow
victory (53.65%) of the ‘yes’ camp indicates the divided opinion on the issue. Not
only did less than 20,000 people swing the vote, but Malta was also the only state
to have a major political party, the Labour Party, opposing membership to the EU.72

This degree of ‘euro-scepticism’ was unparalleled in all the other accession states
of 2004.  Indeed, in Cyprus the lack of ‘euro-scepticism’ was seen by some as
naïve, as integration into the EU would necessarily involve costs as well as
benefits.73

Moreover, as Trimikliniotis has noted in relation to the accession debate in
Cyprus, the extreme positions taken – the “Europhoria” and the “demonization” –
concealed the true colours and consequences of integration.74 This was certainly
also the case in Malta, where the campaign for and against Europe was deeply
entangled with the polarisation of party politics and the debate therefore remained
shallow and highly sensationalised. With regard to the present migration reality, the
countries continue to oscillate between blaming the EU on the one hand, for all their
migration woes, for not doing enough to support the small, “vulnerable” border
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states and on the other hand, hailing the EU as the answer to their prayers, the only
way forward in managing the migration issues at hand. Nevertheless, some
practical measures have been taken by both countries to address concerns, such
as the seven-year period during which EU nationals wanting to work in Malta must
apply for a work permit, just as non-EU nationals must.75 What was not explicitly or
adequately addressed in the discussion of migration is the fact that European
integration, while involving the inclusion of some into an area of relatively open
national borders, also involves the exclusion of others through the hardening of
external borders. Thus although Malta and Cyprus have presumably increased their
political power globally by joining the EU, they are still minor players and have been
expected to increase migration controls and fortify their borders as gatekeepers to
the EU. 

As border states, Cyprus and Malta are both acutely aware of the
consequences of this logic. The Dublin II Convention, which all member states must
adhere to as part of the acquis communautaire, stipulates that asylum seekers must
apply for asylum in the first EU country they reach, ostensibly to reduce the risk of
‘asylum shopping’. In both countries, the Convention has been seen to produce an
unfair ‘burden’ in terms of migration numbers and has had implications for Search
and Rescue (SAR) missions. Malta’s SAR region spans over 250,000 square
kilometres of the Mediterranean and effectively means that every boat leaving Libya
must pass though the region.76 Before joining the EU, Malta’s unwritten policy was
to help boats in distress before sending them on their way to mainland Europe, their
intended destination. However, due to the Dublin II Convention, the government is
currently required to process the asylum claims of migrants whom the Armed
Forces intercept within the SAR region. Although the Armed Forces are expected
to come to the aid of boats in distress in the region, they allow others to pass
through without intervening. The boats asking for assistance are brought into
Maltese ports and the migrants aboard are transported to one of the detention
centres, from where they can initiate the asylum process.77

In Cyprus, which also has a large SAR region, relative to its landmass, of
176,000 square kilometres, the issue is again complicated by the division of the
island.78 As stated earlier, the numbers of irregular migrants arriving by sea are
much less significant than those in Malta. However, it has been suggested by the
Cypriot Coast Guard that most boats attempt to travel through Cypriot waters in
order to land north of the “green line” in the Turkish-controlled part of Cyprus, where
regulations are seen to be more lax and from where one can easily travel overland
across the demilitarised line to the southern part of the island.79

What is clear on both islands is that the Dublin II Convention and EU
membership have resulted in the redefinition and related shoring up and reassertion
of their borders through the incorporation of more restrictive migration controls
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facilitated by new technologies and expertise. In Malta and Cyprus, the implications
are conditioned by the fact that they are both island states with blue borders. This
has had two crucial consequences: first and perhaps foremost, the reality of blue
borders results in a high degree of immobility for migrants and refugees, especially
in light of the Convention’s authorisation of surveillance and tracking measures,
such as fingerprinting, used to return asylum seekers to the first country of arrival
within the EU. Secondly, these blue borders are much more difficult to control than
land borders as they cannot be demarcated in the same fashion, by building a wall
or establishing guard towers. Sea borders are also multiple, involving layers of
different types of inclusion and exclusion. Territorial waters, contiguous zones,
exclusive economic zones and search and rescues regions encompass
progressively more area in the Mediterranean causing Maltese and Cypriot SAR
regions to be much larger than the islands’ territorial waters, which extend 12
nautical miles or 22 kilometres out to sea. So, for instance, Malta has territorial
waters comprising 3,800 square kilometres, while its SAR region spans over
250,000 square kilometres. Even when boats are intercepted within these waters,
it is impossible to return migrants without the cooperation of bordering countries,
such as Libya. Thus the FRONTEX patrol, Operation Nautilus II, launched in 2007
has largely operated as a rescue team, helping boats in distress and taking those
on board to the nearest member state, Malta or Italy, rather than stemming the flow
of migrants trying to enter Europe, its professed aim.80

The issue of an ‘unfair burden’ has recently been addressed within the EU
Justice and Home Affairs Council and in the European Pact on Immigration and
Asylum,81 an agreement that was proposed by Nicholas Sarkozy in July 2008, when
France took over the Presidency of the European Council, and was subsequently
adopted by the Council in October. The Pact is not legally binding, but rather a
political document and in this capacity proposes five commitments: (1) to organise
legal immigration to take account of the priorities, needs and reception capacities
determined by each Member State, and to encourage integration, (2) to control
illegal immigration by ensuring that illegal immigrants return to their countries of
origin or to a country of transit, (3) to make border control more effective, (4) to
construct a Europe of asylum, and (5) to create a comprehensive partnership with
the countries of origin and of transit in order to encourage synergy between
migration and development.  

A running theme within the Pact is the need to strike a ‘balance’ between
stricter migration controls and upholding migrant rights, as well as the rights of non-
member states. The logic of balancing freedom and security, which entered the EU
discourse after the 11 September attacks, has been criticised elsewhere for creating
the illusion not only that liberty and security are similar and comparable types of
concepts, but that they are also antithetical. This trade-off creates a detrimental
tension between human rights and security.82 Moreover, the usefulness of the Pact
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in building a common European migration and asylum policy has also been
questioned. Carrera and Guild highlight nationalism and intergovernmentalism as
the Pact’s guiding principles, arguing that this undermines the Europeanisation of
policies and diverges from the supranational focus seen in recent Commission
communications.83

The Pact does address the issue of ‘burden sharing’ and explicitly points to the
“disproportionate influxes of immigrants” faced by member states on the external
border, gestures that have been received well by Malta and Cyprus.84 However, it
leaves much to be desired as it does not address the issue of mixed migratory flows
and the asylum-migration nexus. The logic employed also ignores the fact that
globalisation, as well as the economic and political structures that exist in the EU
(and the developed world more generally) cause the mixed flows of migration to
varying degrees and in different manners. For example, increasing restrictions and
border controls have increased “illegality” and resulted in more sophisticated
smuggling techniques and the diversification of migration routes, which in turn has
prompted calls for further restrictions. Externalising the responsibility of migration
controls to North African countries with poor human rights records not only
jeopardises migrants’ basic human rights, but has also caused some migrants who
were intending to remain in the region, to instead move on to Europe due to
increasing repression.85

Stuck on the Edge: The Impact of the External Emphasis 
Within the EU as a whole, the migration debate is increasingly focused on the
external dimension, such as repatriations, return directives, readmission
agreements and border controls, rather than the integration of migrants, facilitation
of legal entry into the EU for migrants and asylum seekers, and the protection of
human rights. Over the past twenty years, as borders have been relaxed within the
EU, member states have introduced a torrent of restrictive measures targeting non-
EU nationals, such as extended visa requirements, carrier sanctions, restrictions on
freedom of movement, and limitations on the right to work – all designed to prevent
or deter migrants from turning up on their doorstep and seeking asylum.86 There is
also an evident desire to externalise part of the migration ‘problem’ through
measures such as ‘extraterritorial processing’ and ‘protection in regions of origin’.
These can be clearly seen in the UK’s unsuccessful proposal of 2003 to create
Regional Protection Zones and Transit Processing Centres on the outskirts of the
EU where most asylum applications would be considered in order to restrict the
number of people entering and applying for asylum within the EU. Although some
view this proposal as a way to reduce smuggling and the undertaking of dangerous
journeys by asylum seekers,87 it has also raised many concerns, including the lack
of incentives and resources for countries outside the EU to guarantee minimum
human rights standards.88
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Although the proposal failed, the concepts and ideas behind it have gained
prominence over more progressive proposals, such as development assistance,
debt reduction, and the promotion of human rights and good governance in
countries of origin. These underlying concepts can be seen in new efforts to set up
camps in countries outside the EU, such as Libya, and in the shift towards bilateral
agreements with these countries.89 Malta and Cyprus find themselves on the edge
of the EU and have had their own migration debates affected by the larger
European discourse. Control and restrictions have become ubiquitous without
thought of human consequences. In Malta, repatriations are increasingly common,
although the government maintains that it lacks the funds to repatriate all the
migrants it would like to. Nevertheless, reports have accused the government of
repatriating migrants to countries where they face extreme danger, as with a group
of Eritrean migrants repatriated in 2002 and jailed and tortured upon their arrival.90

There are also reports of migrants being repatriated back to Libya.91 Deportation is
also practiced in Cyprus where 2,892 people where deported in 2007 and 2,983 in
2006. The police have noted that these deportation numbers are dependant on the
holding capacity of prisons where migrants are detained and which are currently
reported to be at ‘full capacity’.92 

The externalisation or ‘delocalisation’ of the migration ‘problem’ has also taken
place through bilateral agreements that address the readmission of irregular
migrants and the co-operation of law enforcement between EU members and non-
members.93 Due to the slow process of harmonisation of asylum policies in the EU,
there has also been a proliferation of such agreements made with non-member
countries that border the Union, often in order to negotiate repatriation agreements.
For example, there have been continued attempts by Italy to attract Libya into law
enforcement co-operation in attempts to curb irregular migration, aimed especially
at Libya’s (un)willingness to strengthen its border controls. Since 2003, Italy and
Libya, as well as Spain and Morocco, have collaborated in joint patrols and the
readmission of migrants, often even those who are not nationals, but have transited
these countries, in exchange for aid.  

Understandably, there has been fierce criticism of these negotiations with
countries that have, at best, dubious human rights records.94 The Libyan judicial
system, for example, has no procedure in place for asylum seekers and is not a
signatory to the 1951 Geneva Convention that provides protection to refugees. In
light of these factors, the agreements are seen as attempts to deny access to
asylum processes within Europe. Such bilateral agreements, as well as the
portrayal of migration as a security challenge, have also fostered the militarisation
of the southern European border, where military (and semi-military) forces and
hardware are increasingly deployed in attempts to prevent migration by sea. This
security framework has become even more prevalent in the aftermath of the 11
September terrorist attacks and the subsequent attacks in Madrid and London.95
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Indeed, the focus in the Mediterranean should be a humanitarian one based on
human rights and the protection of vulnerable people. The headlines reporting the
deaths and drowning of migrants in their attempts to cross the Mediterranean Sea
and the untold numbers that have died silently reflect the human tragedy that is
being allowed to happen. Human Rights Watch report that 100,000 people attempt
to cross the Mediterranean every year and that over the past decade, 10,000 have
died trying.96 Although humanitarian grounds are often used as a justification for the
need and increase in sea patrols involving co-operation from nation states on the
southern and northern shore of the Mediterranean,97 this argument obscures the
fact that tighter controls have resulted in migrants taking greater risks by attempting
voyages in rickety boats during winter months when the seas are rough, voyages
that are longer and more dangerous, resulting in more deaths at sea. The shifting
of migration in response to increasing border controls has been witnessed already
in Western Africa, where increased controls in the Straits of Gibraltar and around
the enclaves of Ceuta and Melilla resulted in migrants and refugees increasingly
choosing the Canary Islands as their destination instead of Southern Spain.98 In
turn, the fortification of patrols along the West African route, in part by the
FRONTEX HERA I and II missions, has been said to have partially caused the
increase of migrants and refugees coming through the central Mediterranean.99

These unforeseen consequences make clear that although policy and political
rhetoric has been restrictive, draconian, and even xenophobic, the effects of policy
on the ground are more subtle and varied. Migrants’ ability to react and respond in
varying degrees to structures that help or hinder their journeys reflect their agency
– their autonomy, will, flexibility and persistence. Migrant agency, coupled with
restrictions, has resulted in part in increasingly varied and dangerous migration
routes being taken. This along with the impossible nature of patrolling borders
absolutely and the narrow political categories that define the “wanted” from the
“unwanted” and thus justify the fortification of borders, results in irregular migrants
entering host countries. Domestic business interests, supranational bodies such as
the EU and international human rights norms also affect the inclusionary and
exclusionary measures taken vis-à-vis migrants, often resulting in the inclusion of
more migrants than governments acknowledge. Indeed, the focus on “boat people”
and on the militarisation of the EU’s external borders can be viewed as a red
herring, a convenient way for states to appear tough on migration, while
accommodating business interests and the need for migrant labour, especially in
light of the majority of irregular migrants in the EU being ‘overstayers’.  

Conclusion

Migration is often viewed as having negative social and economic consequences, a
justification for tighter migration controls. I argue here, as others have done,100 that
the negative consequences are largely due to and certainly exacerbated by the
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pursuit of control and the restrictive policies that are justified in the name of
protecting citizens. Migration controls produce illegality, marginalising migrants and
asylum seekers within the societies of receiving states. The vulnerability and
precariousness associated with illegality allows for the exploitation of migrants
within the labour market, benefiting employers who pay them low wages.101 As
Saskia Sassen notes, “Border enforcement is a mechanism facilitating the
extraction of cheap labour by assigning criminal status to a segment of the working
class – illegal immigrants.”102 Thus, in Malta and Cyprus, migrants and asylum
seekers are exploited by employers who are able to pay them below the minimum
wage, withhold payment, and impose dangerous working conditions. The
marginalisation of migrants was made clear in a shocking Supreme Court decision
in Cyprus where a judge ruled in favour of a Cypriot employer who had withheld
payment from one of his employees, a third country national, on the basis of his not
having a work permit at the time.103

The exclusion of migrants and asylum seekers from mainstream society, along
with practices of detention and deportation,104 sends a clear message of these
people being “unwanted”. The discrimination they endure in housing, healthcare,
and employment, leads to their further marginalisation and ghettoisation, fuelling
racism and xenophobia.105 Thus by rendering migrants socially and politically
powerless, the state promotes the monetary interests of business by providing a
cheap labour pool, while simultaneously undermining the working class and the
wider society within its own borders.

Despite the different reactions by Malta and Cyprus due to divergent histories,
geographies and cultures, the focus in both has been on short-term control, while
long-term considerations such as the integration of migrants and refugees have
fallen by the wayside and the human rights of ‘illegal’ migrants have suffered an
even worse fate.106 Membership in the European Union has facilitated the emphasis
on exclusion and influenced the ‘repressive’ elements of policy,107 especially
through the redefinition of Cypriot and Maltese borders as external borders. The
pressure exerted for these external borders to be fortified due to the relaxation of
internal borders, along with the attempts to externalise control and protection
measures, has closed off possible legal routes for migrants and asylum seekers to
enter the European Union.   

In southern Europe, there are also negative implications for member states,
which adjoin countries that are (thus far) uninvited and possibly uninterested in EU
membership. This artificial division imposed by the EU has further exacerbated
tensions created by economic, political, cultural, and religious divides in the
Mediterranean.108 Within the EU, the Dublin Convention reinforces a hierarchy and
increases levels of distrust between core and periphery states whereby states on
the fringes must act as “gatekeepers” or “outposts”. Others have also labelled
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Cyprus, in particular, an “entrance hall” or “waiting room” for migrants attempting to
transit to other European countries.109 Although these analogies are useful in that
they reflect the experiences of many migrants in Malta and Cyprus, it is important
to point out their limitations and ways in which they may be misleading. For
instance, within the broader EU context, the numbers arriving in these countries are
small and the numbers wanting to continue on to mainland Europe even smaller.

Research shows that the vast majority of irregular migrants arrive in Europe
through legal channels and either overstay their visas or take up employment
outside the legal terms of their visas. And yet, the member states that make up the
European Union have increasingly focused their rhetoric, money, and time on
FRONTEX patrols in the Mediterranean, on restricting asylum application to the first
country of arrival through the Dublin II Convention, and on erecting fences, walls,
and barbed wire in Ceuta and Melilla, Bulgaria and Slovakia, to create an image of
“fortress Europe”. These exclusionary measures are costly, partially ineffective and
more often than not result in the exclusion of those that are the most in need of
protection, those that cannot afford to buy a plane ticket into Europe.

There is also a clear contradiction as businesses recruit migrant labour, usually
through short-term residence schemes, in order to fill shortages, while
governments, spurred on by domestic xenophobia and a desire to comply with EU
standards, pursue their political interests by creating barriers to migration in order
to control ‘illegal’ immigration.110 The policy response includes stricter visa
requirements, increased patrolling of land and coastal borders, expedited asylum
applications, the principles of ‘safe country of origin’ and ‘safe third country’,
expulsion of irregular migrants, and the exchange of information with other
Schengen countries on ‘undesirable’ migrants, including asylum seekers.111 

In Malta and Cyprus, these restrictions have produced a segmentation of
society with widely felt social consequences as exclusionary practises and
procedures influence citizens’ perspective of the migration phenomenon and
increase levels of racism and xenophobia. The EU’s exclusionary policies, seen
clearly in border states such as Malta and Cyprus, disenfranchise people who act
as a reserve army of labour and who have little recourse to human rights law and
protection from the state. They are immobilised in a system that boasts increased
mobility and disenfranchised in a system that flaunts democracy. 

* My deepest thanks goes to the two anonymous reviewers and to Hubert Faustmann, the
editor in chief as well as to Nicos Trimikliniotis, the editor, and Christina McRoy, the
assistant editor of this special issue, for all their comments and invaluable help in making
this paper possible. 
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